For data entry

Chitwan Valley Family Study
Household Registry

Confidential: Only for Research

A. Household information

NBH ID #:

HH type

HH ID #

Old HH ID #:

1= Intact

2= Group Quarter

3= Permanent Indian |

Particulars

B. Interview Status

July

August

September October

Start time:

Date:

Respondent's ID #:

Interviewer's ID #:

Interview Time:

Editor's Name:

Household Place:

Particulars

November

December

January

Start time:

Date:

Respondent's ID #:

Interviewer's ID #:

Interview Time:

Editor's Name:

Household Place:
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S.N Respondent Sex Age

Marital Status

Pregnancy Status

Education

1D # July Aug Dec Jan

July | Aug | Sept | Octo | Nov [ Dec | Jan

July | Aug | sept | Octo | Nov | Dec | san

July | Aug | sept | octo [ Nov

22

23

24

25

26

27

***For interviewer 0=Living in the Household

See the last month information and ask Place code= For Living away

the appropriate questions. D = Died

U=Unmarried S=Separate due to quarrel

M=Married D = Divorce/ Elope

A =Separate due to work W = Widow

N=No Pregnant S = Still Birth

P= Pregnant M =Miscarriage

B= Birth A = Abortion

School code = If; individual is in school

Last time we updated your household information in ...............month ........... Year. This time, I am here
to update your household information since that time. In addition, this time I would also like to add if there

any member of your household we left out in the household listing last time, who may have been away from
home at that time. First let me start with people who were in your household last time and I will ask about

those were left out time.

A. At that time ............. was living in this household, is he/she still living or not?

B. Last time............ was away from home is he/she still living away or started living here in your househodl ?

C. Besides these people, is there anybody came to live in your household?

D. Now, are there any member of your household not included above? If there are please tell me their names

*** For Interviewers:
Ask these questions to above 12 years old

respondents.

*** For interviewers:
Ask the questions to 12-45 years old

females.

*** For interviewers:
Ask the questions to 5 to 50 years old

respondents.

A. last month ............... was unmarried/
living (together/ separate )with his/her
spouse, widow, what about now?

B. Besides these is there anybody who get

married, living together/ separate , widow ,

divorced or eloped ?

A. Last month ................ was pregnant

/not pregnant, What about now?

B. Besides these is there anybody in your
household get pregnant, gave birth, still

birth, miscarriage or abortion.

Now lets talk about schooling. By in school we
mean currently going to school, in vacation, between
school, adult education & training and preparing for
exam.

Using this crieteria, how about schooling?

Is in school or not in school?

1= Besides these people, is there anybody else who should be listed as member of your household?

***For interviewers*** If a new person starts living in the household form this month, record name on the name format and ask the questions.

2= Now, I will read the information to you I record aobove. Please tell me if I have not recorded correctly.

3= Finally, did I left any member of your household to record here?

Thank you very much for your precious time and co-operation. Information given by you is very important for us. We will come again for more information. O.K. bye, Namaskar!
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Institute for Social and Environmental Research

Chitwan Valley Family Study
Note Copy

NBH No.: HH No.:

Interviewer's |D#:

Interviewer's ID#:

Interviewer's ID#:

Interviewer's ID#:
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Interviewer's |D#:

Interviewer's ID#:

Interviewer's |D#:
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Call Record
e

Particulars August September October
July First Second Third First Second Third First Second Third
Date:
Interviewer's Name
Result:

Next visit date

End Time:

Editor's Name:

Particulars November December January

First Second Third First Second Third First Second Third

Date:

Interviewer's Name

Result:

Next visit date

End Time:
Editor's Name:

Editor's Nam
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HOUSEHOLD REGISTRY INSTRUMENT
Household Registry

intro2

[First Visit]

Today I am visiting your household to get a list of the household members who have been sleeping and eating
together most of the time in the past six months, their ages, gender and their relationship to each other. Then I also
want to record your household's experiences such as marriage, births, deaths, and living arrangement during the past
month. Who lives in this household?

A W AUEH TREARAT TCH g AEATT GSET FHT G @ Y G HG I qIIEE e
T FEfeRdl S, I T UF ATIHH FF AGT Udgeg Wl IWerd faw g oy e
HieATHT TUTEdl OXA(ERHT faare, +0, dcg, a9e-93s, (el afe & & wedee WU, fader

N c ~

TRAT 4 AHH HE g | qTIeH IXARERAT B a6 g ?

A

[Return Visit]
Last time we spoke with “xHHRespondentNameFill and updated your household information in “xCMStartDC N.
This time, I am here to update your household information since that time.

In addition, this time I would also like to add if there any member of your household we left out in the household
listing last time, who may have been away from home at that time. First let me start with people who were in your
household last time and I will ask about those were left out time.

g 31t g7 AxCMStartDC_N AfRHTHT P4 TUIE S TRUNIR ! SRAT BRI ferdest fa | 7 sifga &
JATCHT SH qUS®| TRUNRARD] BRI SIS T SMIHI G |

I Tedh T8 TR T, THHUST A8, SfRIe Uedh SMeR] el geuue! uRaR®! 9w I a9
Ufes YFFHTST ATFES®! aRAT X1 TRY |

gender

What is “name's gender?
Male
Female

IeT Al &Y & G150 2
Ty
Afga

age
And how old is “name?
0..120

JeT dfa s gHa 2
0..120

last6

Did "“name eat and sleep in this household most of the time last month?
Did not live here last month
Did live here last month

o1 T HiTHT SR Afg oA W X g A 2
TS HigATHT SRS AfR TR -G THgUT
TS| AT IS Al ORAT @H-Yd gl
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location
Where does “name live now?

381 3 el §I58 ?

when_goneM
When did “name leave this HH?
January
February
March
April
May
June
July
August
September
October
November
December
Never
Not Sure

JeT 7Y TRETE $1 AR STIHTH! 8 2
RG]

Hiecd U 33Igd
AT

when_goneY
(When did “name leave this HH?)
2012..9996

38T T TRETE H1 JTHT TIHISD! B 2
2012..9996

whencome M
When will “name be back to live in this HH?
January
February
March
April
May

2 Last modified 11/19/2025 2:20:00 PM
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June

July
August
September
October
November
December
Never

Not Sure

JeT 3 94 R B SMEIE= 2
CRIIRG|

Hieed Ui 3T3Igd
AR

whencome_Y
When will “name be back to live in this HH?
2012..9996

35T 3@ T1 IR e MSTE= 2
2012..9996

Add

Besides these people, is there anybody else who should be listed as member of your household? Now I will read the
information to you I recorded above. Please tell me if I have not recorded correctly.

Are there other household members who are living here now?

Please include if there are any new members added into your household, please tell me their name and all related

information)
Yes
No

T 3feft ... AP .... 7T BT TURS! TR URARG! TRAT TSR foresst Rt | 7 sifga < Jaredt

TSI qUTS ! TRURGRS! STFBRT SEATEid T TS g | gTHIe ifEed Ued STHSR foial afe quget
RINARSD! F TG G HIH! B - T U H IgTeed! aRAT U STH R for are=g | ufgan, siferee
Waﬁwgﬁma@ﬂﬁwquﬁml

A TCIET TRD e AR SR e @fe ) T FHiged Qu 3 a1 9 w1 sfewp! anfy
T3¢ oHT WM X I ORAT Gl TRY 3% Blg] 313 HU! FaNs fob Rune 2 gdt sregHue! fians w1
meﬁ—ﬁ%a | Q1A qUIS R ERHT HTH 7T S8 sfadgsd! A1 Fed T fob & ufy uiRfeggra

mmmwmmwm@w Y IETged! AT STasiedq 8 d | J9 S1gd dursd!
URARAT 3= U 985 fob 2
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BT TRHAT TgTHUHT URIRGT I ST A1 ge 1) for &t ufy ufafeg grar |
3§ A qUTSd fegHUID! SHeR! 31T o foh afe Uer gArsg |
SRATATHRSD! AI: Tt Ho Y& U HUP! B U TEI(ET) D! 719 AReIe I R TeIch! TRAT o SHHR
e 1"
3-8
REREE

name
‘What is this household members name?

JeIPp! ITH & glall 2

gender

What is “name's gender?
Male
Female

38T Aieel T8N & §I578 ?
&Y
afgar

age
And how old is “name?
0..120

36T dfa sl gguar 2
0..120

marital

What is “name's marital status?
Not married
Married

Igih! fae Hue! © fos &7 2
Sifasfed
forafed

last6

Did “name eat and sleep in this household most of the time last month?
Did not live here last month
Did live here last month

3BT MU AT SR Afg TRAT W X G Tg=A 2
U AT SRR Tfe oA WA T2
T AiGATHT R AT ORAT TH-Yd TigA!

location
Where does “name live now?

381 3ifed P8l g8 2

when_goneM
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When did “name leave this HH?
January
February
March
April
May
June
July
August
September
October
November
December
Never
Not Sure

JeT 7Y TRETE $1 AR STIHTH! 8 2
RG]

Hiecd U TSTgd
S &

when_goneY
(When did “name leave this HH?)
2012..9996

38T T TRETE H+1 JTHT SIHISD! 81 2
2012..9996

whencome M
When will “name be back to live in this HH?
January
February
March
April
May
June
July
August
September
October
November
December
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Never
Not Sure

JET 3F T4 TR e HBIES 2
CRIIRG|

Hied Ui 3T3Igd
CUIEER]

whencome_Y
When will “name be back to live in this HH?
2012..9996

3BT 3fd 1 TR Hied IS ?
2012..9996

spouse
(Let us talk about the relationship of your household members to each other.)
Does “name's (“age) spouse live in the household?

3§ BT qUTS! TR URIRST ewgs fod & & A1 Uds I IRAT Sa%hd TR |
D, “name ("age) CAEIEIRIEIt il ﬁm”

parents
(Let us talk about the relationship of your household members to each other.)
Do any of “name's (“age) parents live in the household?

. “name ("age) Cal S{THI/FET Cal glgo?
children

(Let us talk about the relationship of your household members to each other.)
Do any of “name's (“age) children live in the household?

. “name (“age) DI BRIBR DI glg®?

siblings
(Let us talk about the relationship of your household members to each other.)
Do any of “name's (“age) siblings live in the household?

Y. “name (“age) Cal aqﬂm‘ﬂ%‘cﬁ gfgt &1 g8l ®?

grandparents
(Let us talk about the relationship of your household members to each other.)

6 Last modified 11/19/2025 2:20:00 PM
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Do any of “name's (“age) grandparents live in the household?

S “name ("age) Gl ORE /E\_YRG‘I'I'J:ITﬁ g1g®?
Household Location

HHloc
Last time we visited you, your household was in “xHHLocation (“xLocationFill), does your household still live in
~xHHLocation (“xLocationFill) or has it moved anywhere else for more than 15 days between *pixCMStartDC_E
and "pixCMEndDC E?

Yes

No

paps ichiial Errﬁﬂ?r IECAR] ﬁ:lla T‘TCIEY'B"(R ~xHHLocation (“xLocationFill) HT a@(gﬂ@u‘r, Ig ufs
ApixCMStartDC_N &3 ApixCMEndDC_N ™ qUISg% ~xHHLocation (*xLocationFill) T ¥ SREGIES 1o 34
&1 a1 9 YT Sfes! Tt 3 S THTa! RS 2

R

HERAR]

locationl
Where was your household in ~xCM_Eng_Eng?

qATSES ~xCM_Nep Nep HI Hg! SgHTH! T 2

Living Status
living
Last time we visited you “name was living in ~xLivingLocation (“xLocationFill).
Has "“name's living status changed at anytime between "pixCMStartDC _E and "pixCMEndDC E?

T 31fY G TSR fefaT ~name ~xLivingLocation (“xLocationFill) HI W I
T Ul ~name ~pixCMStartDC_N e pixCMEndDC N U ~xLivingLocation ("xLocationFill) HI | aﬁR—Eﬂ

Ul B b QU o a1 4 we sfe ) anffl o Fd @M a3 TRY S HUah! R 2

living1
Where was “piName (“xEligRAge) living in “~xCM_Eng Eng?

~piName (“xEligRAge) “xCM_Nep Nep HI SR ﬁfaﬁw Tt
Away Sheet

Street_address
Where is “piname?

CRHEFRREEMN

Apartment
(Where is “piname?)

CHEIIRREER)

City
(Where is “piname?)

7 Last modified 11/19/2025 2:20:00 PM

CAPI Household Registry Instrument months 193-305



(ART PRI EIED ?)

Country

(Where is “piname?)

(TET P §IED )

District

What District does “piname live in?
(81 B T 8380 2)

Telephone
Do you have “piname telephone number or any other contact information?

TRIh! SRTB TR 37dT TS T F 3 TR S 2

Email
Do you have "“piname email address?

TUISHT TETh! SHA ST B 2

Friend_telephone
Do you have Friends telephone number?

TUISHT ggie! Arfie! R = 2

Friend_email
Do you have Friends email address?

JUISHT agich! rfiep! ST ST S 2

Best_contact

What is the best way to contact (him/her/*piname's friend)?"
Telephone
Email
Other -- specify

TETATS JaH-<T JRTARETT b T+ HIeAH & gicl 2
2RMB
EE
3 (GASH B

Best_contact_Specify
(What is the best way to contact (him/her/piname's friend)?)

Jglclls TaH=T JRIARET Treh T H1eqH & giell 2

Left_lastM
When was “piname left home last time?
January
February
March
April

8 Last modified 11/19/2025 2:20:00 PM
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May

June

July
August
September
October
November
December
Never

Not Sure

81 UfSea! U BRETC S1eR Hied SIIHTH! 8l 2
CRIIRG|

Hieed Ui 338
IR

Left_lastY
(When was “piname left home last time?)
2012..9996

a6l Ul Ued TRETC SIfeR Bige SHI! &l 2

2012..9996

Why
Why did “piname left home?
Was it for study, work, marriage, visit, medical treatment or some other reason?
Study
Service
Marriage
Visit
Medical Treatment
Other -- specify

el el fobT ST €1 2 UgTeh! il STgHUeh 8 fob, ore 7+ o1 SR = S Huas! 2 f, g w
Hﬁwma%,gfﬁwﬁmwam SRPIAR T+ SHTS! 1 5, 3% $ HRU TTHTH! 1 2

P TH-SR T
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Why (Specify)
(Why did “piname left home?)

eI G febT FIIHTDI &1 2

When_comeM
When do you think “piname coming back home either permanently or temporarily?
January
February
March
April
May
June
July
August
September
October
November
December
Never
Not Sure

Wﬁwwwawﬁwwmwmwmwm

Hiecd Ui S3Igd
ST &

When_comeY
(When do you think "“piname coming back home either permanently or temporarily?)
2012..9996

JUTSATS, I8T B T TR 3YaT Hie IS AT Hied TR IHET §S ol drD 2
2012..9996

Marital Status

MarStat
Last time we visited you, “piName ("piAge) was “xMaritalStatus. Has “name's marital status changed at anytime
between "pixCMStartDC_E and *pixCMEndDC E?

Yes

No

10 Last modified 11/19/2025 2:20:00 PM
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IRadT YT B 2

ARG ApixCMEndDC_N 9H

9 3ffd g TSGR ﬁa, ~piName (“piAge) “xMaritalStatus Eﬂﬁ_'uﬁ T UfS “name I pixCMStartDC N
fRufere P

3
B4

maritall
What was “piName's (*xEligRAge) marital status in “xCM_Eng_Eng?
Married, living with spouse
Married, not living with spouse
Unmarried
Widowed
Divorced
Separated — disagreement
First Time Married

~xCM._Nep_Nep AT ~piName ("xEligRAge) P! salfged Rufa & i
NIPECIEIRD]
BTG AT - T ge
(3MfaaTR) BTeT T forg THTD!
fayarfaR

TR .
ST IR A - T Fe
1fog YR 3T

Pregnancy

PregStat

Last time we visited you, “piName ("piAge) was “xPregStatus. Has “name's pregnancy status changed at anytime

between “pixCMStartDC_E and "“pixCMEndDC_E?
Yes
No

9 3ffY g SR 1%13'[ ~piName (“piAge) “xPregStatus |
pGCMEndDC N T Il (“piName) Tyfemor fRufemm

Bﬁs‘?—%—vr

pregl

What was *piName's (*xEligRAge) pregnancy status in “xCM_Eng Eng?
Reproductive inactive
Not pregnant
Pregnant
Live birth
Miscarriage
Stillbirth
Abortion
Respondent sterilized
Live Birth — Nonfamily
Twin Birth - family

~xCM_Nep_ Nep HI “piName ("xEligRAge) B THTYROT fRUfT o fa
11
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T UT3 e
=T UG

1 UTSH (T
fI3e! St !

T

TR gl ST

T TRISTHTS!

ITRETT SRATRUT THHUDT
fSR3<) 9= SR - BS TR

RATET ST Sl

Education

edu
Now let's talk about schooling. By in school we mean currently going to school, in vacation, between school, adult
education & training and preparing for exam.
Using this criteria, was “piName ("“piAge) in school or not in school during the months between *pixCMStartDC _E
and "pixCMEndDC E?
Last time we visited you, [name] was attending the following school: [school]. Did [name] attend this school
between [month and year] and [month and year]?

Yes, Attending same school

Yes, Attending different schools

No, did not attend school during this time

Same as last visit

3a BTHY UGTS SaT W aTeh! IRHT BT TRT | I SfF WIS Tpdl WG TR, Tl faal HUdl, oiid fow a8y,
e e Y 1 aiferm fore TRep! X Sifadh! @i qar) 718 TRa! 4 §3Iues |

It HRIATS AR TTet, ApiName @I("piAge)@I “pixCMStartDC_N GRY ApixCMEndDC_N TG S HUa!
3aT P arferd faguus! R 6 e 2

9 3ffd grfid SHeRT f?‘l—q‘s[’, [name], [school] SITS gg==AT | & [name] [month and year] ARG [month and year] =g
THA/FATHT TS g ?

T, T3C R el TEREIHID! B

T, e BReh T SIHID ©

B, Y S I U
~xSameAsEDUPreloadNep

edul

Using this criteria, what school did [name] attend during the month of [date]?

Which School/College/Training Center did “piName attended in “xCM_Eng_Eng?
0-900

ApiName "xCM_Nep_Nep HT $+ I al/derol/dTerd dgHT ol HUh! Fane?
0-900

12 Last modified 11/19/2025 2:20:00 PM

CAPI Household Registry Instrument months 193-305



	Paper and pencil Household Registry Instrument through month 192
	CAPI Household Registry Instrument months 193-305

